On Jun 28, 2021, at 11:57 AM, Miten Patel <mitenpatel65@gmail.com> wrote:

Good Afternoon All

Quick Update below. ( detailed update on a later date)

—

Pressure test on the in-ground spa "Passed" . ( Awaiting detailed Report)

There will be an invoice from Leak Detection coming our way after his report.

Rick has almost burned out his initial 15 K and he will be submitting his final invoice

soon.

Concrete around the pool will have to be removed.

Replacement of all inground pipes for Pool and Spa is recommended.

Do we need permits for any of the work we are doing?

We need a plumber to test TWO heaters in the mechanical room and let us know if they

are working. ( they appeared to be in good condition and no need to replace them if they

are working)

8. The General Budget for the pool project ( Pool and Spa work Only) was discussed. It
would be approximately around $ 180,000/- +/- Dependent on the availability of Labor
and purchase of new equipment etc. ( I am going to prepare a spreadsheet for our
discussion on this matter)

9. Rick is still trying his best to give us a detailed scope and budget proposal.

10. Thank you for the Trailer Parking suggestions. ( we will talk about this once we have

schedule of work)

bl

Nowe

We will be in touch soon with more detailed information.
Thank you,

Miten Patel
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